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1 Institute of 
Hotel 
Management, 
Pusa 

June 
2023 

Promotion 
of Sikkim 
Tourism  
 

Under the Ek Bharat Shrestha Bharat campaign 
the Institute of Hotel Management Pusa, New 
Delhi conducted a session for decimating 
Information about SIKKIM, the sister state of 
Delhi. This session was organized for all the 
faculty members and support staff. The day 
started with briefing everyone about the 
Mission and vision statement of Ek Bharat 
Shrestha Bharat.The session included videos to 
enhance the learning experience of the 
participants with respect to culture, cuisine and 
geography of Sikkim. The session also included 
information about their food habits,cuisine, 
dance and places to visit as a tourist. For a 
better understanding of the state regions, 
culture and tourist destinations the information 
was shared using images, videos and some fun 
activities. The entire session was joined by all 
the faculty members, admin staff and support 
staff. The session ended on a high note with all 
enthusiastically planning how and when to visit 
Sikkim with their family and friends. 
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Glimpse of the event: 
 
Session on promoting Sikkim Tourism  
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